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Suzanne Krodel

To: richard.weingart@snet.net
Subject: RE: Fwd: DOT ROW acceptance

__________________________________________________________________________________________________
___________________________________ 

From: Bill Rose 
Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 2:06:15 PM 
To: Chris Zibbideo <CZibbideo@cjmpc.com> 
Cc: Suzanne Krodel (assistant@chaplinct.org) <assistant@chaplinct.org> 
Subject: RE: DOT ROW acceptance  
ï¿½ 
Hi Chris, 
ï¿½ Yes I received the letter this morning. In the letter it says no ROW work will be performed until the 20% match is 
paid in full. That is not a problem but it would be a big help if I knew approx. when and how much money we will need 
so I can budget. Can you look into your crystal ball and give me a rough number and timeline? 
ï¿½ 
Thanks, Bill  
ï¿½ 
Bill Rose 
First Selectman 
Town of Chaplin 
495 Phoenixville Road  
Chaplin,ï¿½ CTï¿½ 06235 
firstselectman@chaplinct.org 
860-455-0073 EXT. 311 

From: Chris Zibbideo <CZibbideo@cjmpc.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2020 11:15:57 AM 
To: Bill Rose <firstselectman@chaplinct.org> 
Subject: DOT ROW acceptance  
ï¿½ 
Hi Bill, you will likely get this officially from the Department but I like to forward them on to be sure you get it. 
ï¿½ 
Chris Zibbideo, P.E., L.S. 
Close, Jensen and Miller, P.C. 
1137 Silas Deane Highway 
Wethersfield, CT 06109 
860-563-9375 
ï¿½ 
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